
MISSIONS EVENT 2022

Prayer Guide
 

For “whoever will call upon the name 
of the name of the Lord will be 
saved.” How then shall they call upon 
Him in whom they have not believed? 
And how shall they believe in Him of 
whom they have not heard? And how 
shall they hear without a preacher?  
And how shall preach unless they are 
sent?  Just as it is written “How 
beautiful are the feet of those who 
bring good news of good things.”  
-Romans 10:13-15 (NAS)
 

Adoration. Lord God we are so 
grateful that You in your great mercy, 
love and grace have provided a way 
for everyone who calls upon you and 



believes in Jesus to be saved from 
our sin by your blood shed for us. We 
are grateful that at an appropriate 
time you revealed our need to us and 
called us to yourself for now and 
eternity. You are so Good, so 
compassionate, so sacrificial in your 
love and we praise you for 
_________ (add your own praises).

Confession. Father God we confess 
that we have fallen far short of your 
best for us in thought word and deed. 
We have done what you have told us 
not to do and we have let undone 
what you have asked of us. We now 
confess our specific needs for Your 
complete and cleansing forgiveness 
trusting that as we confess you are 
“faithful and righteous to forgive us“ 
(1John 1:9). (Add your own 
confession.)



Thanksgiving. Thank you, Lord 
Jesus, for cleansing us of our sins. 
Thank you for this opportunity to meet 
and hear some of the missionaries 
that we support at Redeemer as we 
hear about how God is on the Move 
in their ministries around the world. 
We are so grateful to be part of what 
you are doing now even in the 
pandemic and that your work in the 
world cannot be stopped. Thank you 
for the opportunity to become a 
bigger part of what you are doing 
through our prayers, gifts, and other 
ways you may call us to do. Thank 
you for those who are joining us for 
this event, both mission reps and 
participants. Thank you now for the 
good results we expect from this time 
we spend together. Thank you also 
for ____________ (add your own 
thanksgivings).



Supplication. Heavenly Father we 
ask that you prosper the way of every 
mission representative coming to our 
church for this time whether in 
person, virtually, or by video that each 
one will have a clear and trouble-free 
path for joining us. We pray for their 
preparations; that they are led by 
Your Holy Spirit, anointed, full of 
grace and truth, and timely. We ask 
for your protection over each one as 
they come and over their families and 
loved ones. We ask that everything 
on our end goes smoothly according 
to your best for our guests, for our 
congregation and visitors, for our 
team of technology experts, our 
musicians, our staff, and other 
support people. We pray that this 
event will result in heightened passion 
at Redeemer for your mission of 
“going into all the world making 
disciples of all nations“ (Matthew 
28:19), and increased support for that



mission through our prayers and 
increased giving to our Faith 
Promises. We also pray that 
______________ (add your own 
specific requests for our Missions 
Event).
 
Closing. Thank you, Lord God, for 
hearing our prayers. We believe that 
you are “able to do exceedingly 
abundantly beyond all we ask or 
think, according to the power that 
works within us” (Ephesians 3:20). In 
the mighty Name of Jesus we pray. 
Amen


